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Demonstrably Special Significance 

Site 
Description 

Notes Close 
Proximity 

Local in 
Character 

Beauty Historic 
Significance 

Recreationa
l Value 

Tranquillity Wildlife 
Richness 

Meet 
NPPF  
Criteria 

Field adjacent 
to St Barnabas 

Church, 
Beanacre 

The field behind the Church is used for cricket 
and some community events. It is also used to 
exercise dogs. Has a wild flower meadow and 
MWPC lease land to run a play area. 
Anecdotally understand that the land was left 
to the church as long as used for the 
community 

        

Three Fields 
Parallel to 
Westlands 

Lane on the 
South side 

between the 
A350 and the 
railway bridge 

(Beanacre) 

No- extensive track of land not local in 
character.  Request came from dogwalker. 

        

Roundponds 
(Town) 

Is in the centre of housing areas and provide 
dog walking and space for children to play. 

        

Awdry Avenue 
(Town) 

Is in the centre of housing areas and provide 
dog walking and space for children to play. 
Gives open feel.  

        

Blenheim Park 
(Opposite the 

Pilot) Bowerhill 

Has historical importance as it is the green in 
front of two houses. One of the houses was 
where the officer commanding RAF Melksham 
lived. Believed to be owned by Selwood 
Housing. Registered as a village green by 
MWPC. 

        

Area from 
Bader Park to 
Blenheim Park 

(Bowerhill) 

This is the open space that runs along the 
back of St Athan Close. It is away from the 
traffic so would be a safe place for children to 
play. It is an open space for residents from the 
social housing in Blenheim Park.  

        

Harvard Close 
(Bowerhill) 

Children from nearby houses can play safely 
with very little traffic.  

        

Bowerhill 
Sports Field 
(Bowerhill) 

This is a sport and recreational field where 
organised sport can be played. Do not need to 
protect as it is designated as a Field in Trust?  
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Beaufort Close 
to Kestrel 

Court 
(Bowerhill) 

This is the open space in the centre of 
Bowerhill that provides space for nearby 
children to play safely away from the traffic. 
This culminates in the Kestrel Court Play Area 

        

Duxford Close- 
Bader Park 
(Bowerhill) 

This is a small area of open space between 
Duxford Close and Bader Park and provides a 
safe area for children to play.  

        

Locking Close 
(Bowerhill) 

This is a small open space that has a footpath 
connecting Locking Close to Bowerhill Lane 
and the pedestrian access route to the canal 
(bridle way and picnic area) 

        

Hornchurch 
Road open 

space 
(Bowerhill) 

This is the only public open space for the 
residents of the East of Bowerhill. It contains 
the MUGA and children’s play area. MWPC 
are to install a new footpath to connect up and 
make the footpaths a circular route. 

        

Area from 
Mitchell Drive 
to Wellington 

Drive 
(Bowerhill) 

This is an open space that starts at Mitchell 
Drive, runs down the back of Sunderland 
Close and Bowerhill Primary School and opens 
into a large Field at the back of Wellington 
Drive. It is a large area suitable for playing 
football and maybe the site for a basketball 
court. Has goal posts. 

        

Primrose 
Nature Reserve 

(Town) 

It is an area that has been developed by the 
community to provide a natural place for all 
sorts of wildlife. It is an area that allows local 
people to sit and meet up.  

        

Rear of 
Duxford Close 

(Bowerhill) 

It is an area that is used for dog walking. 
BRAG (Bowerhill Residents Action Group) 
have planted trees to hide the view of Gompels 
warehouse in the neighbouring industrial 
estate. 

        

Near 
Hornchurch 

Road 
(Bowerhill) 

Small space by substation. Children play here 
(painted wicket stumps on rear of substation) 

        

Green Space 
adjacent to 
play area in 

Skylark Road 
(East of 

Melksham) 

Open space within a newly developed housing 
area which is used by the local community 
area on a daily basis. Hedgerows provide 
habitat for nesting birds of different species. 
Large established trees that pre- date the 
housing development. St Andrew Church runs 
three fun days per year on this piece of land 
for the whole community.  
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Philip Close 
(Town) 

Informal recreational space. Does not meet 
NPPF Criteria because it’s too small.  

        

Mills Road 
(Town) 

Informal Play Space in housing development 
with small back gardens 

        

Sarum Avenue 
(Town) 

Used as an informal play area by children. 
Gives an open space feel to the area and it’s in 
the middle of the community area.  

        

Crescent Road 
(Town) 

Informal play area. Small area of bulb planting 
on verge. Does not meet NPPF criteria 
because it is too small. At the corner of Church 
Lane and Forest Road. No room for bench as 
to close to traffic. 

        

Foresters Park 
Road (Jubilee 
Field)  Town 

Formal and informal play space. All play 
equipment now removed. Owned by MTC. 
Query that it needs designation because it is 
already designated as Field in Trust (Diamond 
Jubilee 2012). 

        

Sangster 
Avenue (Town) 

Informal Green Space. Children’s Play Area. 
Does not meet NPPF Criteria because the 
grass verge is too small.  

        

Little John 
Avenue (Town) 

Does not meet NPPF Criteria because it’s too 
small.  

        

Land adjacent 
Linnet Lane 

and Redwing 
Road (East of 

Melksham) 

Small space.         

Spring 
Meadows 

Playing Field 
(Town) 

The playing field is used by children for playing 
various games and has adjacent changing 
room facilities and play area. Field is also used 
for dog walkers.  

        

Land owned by 
hospital, field 

(Town) 

Currently used for dog walking- uncut grass.          

Melksham 
House old 

Rugby pitch 
(Town) 

Informal recreation area. In the middle of 
Town.  

        

Riverside Drive 
(Town) 

Informal and formal play area. Beauty because 
its adjacent to river, trees and shrubs.  

        

Old Christie 
Miller Golf 

Not easily accessible          
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Course 
(Bowerhill) 

Riverside Walk 
(Town) 

Meets all criteria          

Conigre Nature 
Reserve 
(Town) 

         

The Crays 
(Town) 

Informal green space- Childrens Play area. St 
Andrews Church used to hold Easter service 
there and walk to church.  

        

Ex Sports field 
George Ward, 
Rear of Dunch 
Lane (Town) 

Access by back gates to playing field.          

Berryfield Play 
Area 

MWPC have 7 year lease devolved service for 
play area. Community asset.  Selwood own 
access road and car park. has Teen shelter 
and half MUGA. Whole community involved in 
events. Site of temporary village hall 

        

East of 
Melksham 

Designated Flood Plain 
Green corridor in middle of new housing 
development.  

        

Shails Lane, 
Berryfield 

Well used for those accessing Bowerhill and 
further afield such as Melksham Oak. Dog 
walkers.  Access to sewage works. 
Ex RAF access (before RAF camp) 

        

Triangle piece 
of land on 

entrance to 
Berryfield Lane 

Used by dog walkers. Planted with bulbs and 
gives an open feel to the area. ‘CPRE’ best 
kept village judges talked about open park feel 
on entering area.  

        

Old Railway 
Line, Berryfield 

Not walkable . Canal planning application 
identified it as a bat feeding area.  

        

Thackeray 
Crescent  
(Town) 

Informal Green space.          

Berryfield 
Allotments  

Has formal/ business tenancy. MWPC have 
legal agreement but no first refusal. 
Community asset.  

        

Briansfield 
Allotments 

Has formal/ business tenancy. MWPC have 
legal agreement but first refusal. Community 
orchard in area. Community Wiltshire heritage 
apple trees. Has a car park.  
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Land 
surrounding 

and in 
Westward 

Farm Berryfield 

Is a bat feeding area and has 11 species of 
bat.  

        

Brunswick 
Park 

(Hazelwood 
Road) Town 

Play area for wide area including Kenilworth 
estate. Close to houses and access to town for 
pedestrians.  

        

Old Berryfield 
Lane 

Copse area off A350. Informal green space.          

Hazelwood/ St 
Michaels 
(Town) 

Used for football and children’s play. Access to 
Aloeric School.  

        

Hornbeam 
Crescent rear 

of Western 
Way  (Town) 

Nice open area (village green feel)         

St Michael’s 
Road (Corner) 

Town 

Used as informal open space.          

A350 Bund 
along 

Laburnum 
Avenue  
(Town) 

Bund to protect residents from traffic noise.          

Kingsbury 
Square (Town) 

No demonstrable value.         

Pond in 
grounds of 
Melksham 

House (Town) 

Wildlife rich 
Could be improved,  scruffy at present.  

        

Prince of 
Wales Gardens 

(Town)  

Has Roundhouse listed building. Owned and 
maintained by MTC. Area used as a space of 
tranquillity by residents and workers.  

        

Lowbourne Car 
Park (Town) 

Tiny space         

Old Canal 
Route along 

Old Semington 
Road 

(Berryfield) 

Know wildlife corridor’ Lots of people use this 
to access the canal and Semington. Main 
Route for residents in Semington to access 
Melksham.   
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Off Western 
Way opposite 

Hornbeam 
Crescent 
(Town) 

Thick copse of trees.          

 


